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Businessman discovers his peculiar origins right before getting married. 
 
HERTFORDSHIRE- After a weekend spent in his country estate, a source close to Worthing 
confirmed that after years of mystery, he found out about his origins. This news comes days 
after Worthing announced his engagement to socialite Gwendolyn Fairfax. 
 
When asked about his family in 1892, Worthing stated in an interview that he has no blood-
relatives and was "found in a large handbag in the cloakroom of Victoria Station in London". 
He was adopted into a wealthy family by Mr. Cardew and grew up on the family estate in 
Hertfordshire. After Mr. Cardew's death, Worthing inherited the estate, which he uses as his 
country house, and became the guardian of Mr. Cardew's granddaughter, Cecily Cardew 
who is now set to marry Worthing's best friend, Algernon Moncrief, fellow London resident. 
 
Lady Bracknell openly stated that "Miss Prism used to work for my poor sister, Mrs. 
Moncrieff. Whilst helping at Lord Bracknell's house, she took the male baby out for a walk in 
a perambulator 28 years ago. Miss Prism never returned with the baby and it was after a few 
weeks that the perambulator was discovered with a three-volume novel inside. The baby 
was nowhere to be seen" when asked as to the explanation of this situation by a reporter. 
 
It was revealed that Jack Worthing was left at the Victoria Line station by accident, by Miss 
Prism, the current governess that is now coincidentally hired by him to work with his niece, 
Cecily. Miss Prism has confessed to being so engulfed in her novel whilst taking a stroll with 
the baby, that she left him unattended at the cloakroom. Had Worthing not been connected 
to the Bracknell family through his engagement to Gwendolyn Fairfax, this story would have 
never seen the light of day and shaken Worthing's life. 
 
The commotion caused by the news on Sunday is said to have impacted Worthing, but not 
altered any wedding plans. After living his whole life not knowing of any of his relatives, 
Worthing is now discovering them. Lady Bracknell is said to be Worthing's aunt. The 
shocking news comes as a source claims that fiancées may be relatives now. The pair have 
not been seen in the public eye since before the news, avoiding a possible publicity scandal. 
 
The family is spending time away from their usual duties, getting to know each other, and 
getting used to a new life. 
 


